
Marketable Skills for School of Nursing 
 
Degree and Major: ___MSN-EDU________________________________ 
 
After completing the Master of Science in Nursing: Education degree program at UT Tyler, the student 
can 

Soft Skills: Hard Skills: Unique Features of Program 
(what separates UT Tyler’s 
program from others) 

• Address challenging 
problems and issues through: 
creative thinking, inquiry, 
innovation, analysis, 
evaluation, and synthesis of 
information including 
numerical data or observable 
facts. 

Create a curriculum.  
Write student learning 
outcomes.  
Create valid and reliable 
exams. 
Design appropriate assignments 
for each level of nursing 
student. 
Construct a course syllabus. 
Design and implement 
academic education courses for 
nurses. 

• Career supports throughout 
the entire degree program. 

• Respond in an ethical manner 
by connecting data, behavior, 
choices, consequences to 
ethical theories. 

Integrate nursing education 
theories with current nursing 
practice. 

UTT MSN Education faculty 
use a strength based program 
that allows students to learn by 
developing their individual 
strengths and applying them to 
the learning process. 

• Communicate ideas effective 
through written, oral, and 
visual delivery modes. 

Conduct course, clinical, and 
program evaluations based on 
national standards. 
 

UTT MSN Education faculty 
act as a liaison between the 
student and the Dean at the 
practicum site to secure 
practicum placements for each 
student. 

• Work effectively in teams. Collaborates effectively with 
students, faculty, practicing 
nurses, and other healthcare 
professionals in the classroom 
and clinical environment. 
 

UTT MSN Education faculty 
promote the use of Problem 
Based Learning that allows 
students to work in small teams 
to solve problems while 
enhancing their critical thinking 
skills. 

• Advance the human condition 
through learned international 
cultural competence, 
knowledge of civil 
responsibility, and a 
foundational knowledge of 
human behavior. 

Apply teaching, service, and 
scholarship to the advanced 
practice role of nurse 
educators. 

UTT MSN Education faculty 
use a caring philosophy to 
promote a safe and positive 
learning environment based on 
respect for all students. 

 


